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Taio no Nioi
UNCOMMON WONDROUS ITEM

Taio no Nioi
Wondrous Item, uncommon 

This small ceramic jug is made with a rough gemstone 
of Taiyō inside. The pottery process utilizes a special 
kind of kiln that uses radiant energy instead of fire. 
That way, the jug and the cup absorb the magical 
properties of the Taiyō gem and become forever filled 
with radiant power. This jug can hold up to 4 cups of 
drink and produces 1d4 doses of a magical sake called 
Taiyō no nioi, or Sun Whiff, every day at dawn.  

You can spend an action to pour a cup of sake and 
drink its content. After drinking, for 1 minute, you gain 
resistance to cold damage as your body fills with a cozy 
warm sensation. A reassuring feeling of power 
dominates your head, a sensation that no one can harm 
you. For the duration, you gain advantage in all tests to 
avoid being frightened. 

In addition you feel your throat burning with radiant 
energy. The effect doesn't harm you in any way. For 
the duration, you can use your action to exhale this 
energy on a 15 ft. cone of Radiant Fire. Each creature 
in the area must make a DC13 Dexterity Saving Throw. 
A creature takes 2d6 radiant damage on a successful 
save and half as much damage on a successful one. 

Once the effects of this drink end, you gain one level 
of exhaustion.


