
Riddled with devastating wounds, I was carried to the hospital after my 

battle. The truth is that I don't have many memories of what happened. I 

was instantly admitted and laid onto a bed which I rested on for 5 days... 

The last thing I knew is that I lost against my doppelganger… I thought I 

had died, but life gives me a second chance ^_^ 

You: I guess the girls faced him and won ... right? 

Damn, I need to be stronger. Maybe I could join a fighting club or 
something ... that would be great.  
 
You: … 
 
Nah, what am I saying?! ... maximizing my physical defense is useless 
against magic damage enemies. I have to find something to make me 
resistant to magic Dx. 
 
You: Ugh! Im so bored U.U 
 
All I’ve been doing this week is sleeping and eating, but im sick of it. 
 
You: If I at least had some videogames like Prince of Ponyville or Pony 
Armageddon or something! Dx… hmmm?... what is this? 
 
Near my bed there is a handwritten note… hmm: 
 
“I hope you are recovering after the legendary beating you have received. 
You are lucky to have those girls as your friends, otherwise you would not 
be reading this letter, if you know what I mean. I still hate you, and will 
hate you for the rest of my life, but I'm glad you're still alive. Eventually we 
will face each other again: man to man, as rivals. Oh and look, the start of 
my new life ... " 
 
A photo? … hmm…. … … … … PFFFFFFFFFFFFFFFFFFF--- NO WAY!!! 
 

What the HECK is this?!!  
 



 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

“My new school! If I want to start my new life, this is the best place to do 

it! I tried to enter Canterlot High, but I remembered that the students look 

for you for those bad things that YOU did, huehuehue ... you remember it, 

right? You peeked to the girls in the bathrooms hahaha !! .. anyway, see 

ya, useless man!” 

You: O_______o’’  

I have no words. Did the girls let him run away? and now he's a student at 

Crystal Prep Academy?! O_O… Right then, I hear a gentle knock on the 

hospital room door. 

R. Dash: hey, can I come in? 

You: oh Dash? Sure. 

Dashie comes inside to the room. 

You: Did you come to check up on me? 

R. Dash: yes, how do you feel?  

You: I broke my left arm hehe, but it'll heal. And for now I can't walk, but 

with therapy I'll be running like a lynx again hahaha  

 

 



R. Dash: We will never forgive those two fools! 

You: hey, take it easy xD . Im fine, like I said, I'll recover and we can run 
together again hahaha. More important, can you explain this to me? 
 
* You show her the photo of the doppelganger * 
 
R. Dash: So he decided to start studying there? Good for him, I guess. 
 
You: hmm? That’s all? Why would he send me this letter and photo? 
 
R. Dash: Well, he was the one who brought you here for some reason ... 
 
You: Why he would do that? he didn't want to finish me? O_O 
 
R. Dash: Actually, I asked him the same thing, but he didn't answer me. 
The truth is I dont care his reasons... we didn't have time, you were 
seriously injured and he was the fastest of us. He…. he's even faster than 
me…. tsk! 
 
Dashie lowers her head. She also seems to be a little angry. 
 
You: That is not true, you are very fast ... and stubborn! I think it's a nice 
virtue of yours hehehe. 
 
R. Dash: I promise you that next time I will be the one to help you! I won't 
let that dirty fool lay a finger on you! 
 
You: ahm… okay, thanks ^-^. 
 
Now she seems very determined! Well, at least she has regained her 
spirits. 
 
R. Dash: So, you cant move your left arm and both legs that well, right? 
 
You: yeah. I guess im going to be in a wheelchair for a while. What about 
you? Are you got hurt? 
 
R. Dash: no, we’re fine.  
 
You: really? Im glad to hear that  



 
R. Dash: if only we were stronger, we could have protected you …  
 
You: dont focus on the negative. Besides, i would have died if it weren’t 
for all of you. Reading this letter, I can infer that you somehow changed 
the doppelganger's mindset. Friendship power, huh? Still, I wouldn't mind 
dying for you ^_^. 
 
R. Dash: dont say that!! 
 
You: oops.. okay :x . Anyway, thanks for always being there for me. I feel I 
can overcome anything with you by my side  
 
R. Dash: I feel the same way  . I can do anything as long as im with you 
^_^. 
 
Dashie face suddenly turns red… o_o.  
 
R. Dash: anyway, here. ¬///¬ 
 
Dash gives me a bag with gold decorations, it's very fancy! Inside the bag 
there are many cookies. None of them appear to be things you can buy at  
the store either. They’re wrapped quite adorably, to boot. 
 
You: oh woow! :O .. look at all these. Dont tell me these are all 
homemade? 
 
R. Dash: Everyone got together in Pinkie kitchen and made them for you. 

You: My goodness! This is the best day of my life! I was actually getting 

sick of the bland hospital food! 

Im truly grateful for the wonderful treats she brought me. I cant really go 

to the store easily either, now that im wheelchair bound. 

You: hey Dashie, where are the others?  

R. Dash: I came on everyone’s behalf so we wouldn’t cause any trouble, 

seeing as there are so many of us. 

You: yeah, that makes sense. Wouldn’t want to make a scene and get 

yelled at by the nurse. 



R. Dash: *sigh* … the truth is that day we brought you here, we all 

wanted to stay until they let us see you, but the doctors obviously 

wouldn't let us do that. 

You: oh i see :O .. I'm sorry to worry you. 
 

R. Dash: Everyone wanted to come see you, so we had to fight over who 

would come.  

You: huh? What? 

R. Dash: haha dont worry ^_^. Remember that with the girls we’re rivals 

after all XD. 

You: rivals?  

Yes, I remember they said the same thing on our beach vacation. O_O 

R. Dash: It was a friendly competition, which I will not go into details ... 

but, I won xD.  

Suddenly, Dashie changes the expression on her face and the tone of her 
voice ... 
 
R. Dash: You don't know how much I wanted to see you… I’m so lonely 
without you. 
 
OOOH??! 0.0 Am I hearing things? Did she just say what I think she said? 
:O 
 
You: Is something the matter? 
 
R. Dash: huh? What are you talking about? :O 
 
You: I mean, you? Lonely? And admitting it, too?  
 
R. Dash: hey! Even I get lonely sometimes… I don’t feel like myself. Just…. 
hurry up and get well! Got it?!  
 
Dashie looks away with an angry pout, but her even her ears are blushing.  
Anyway, the time run when you enjoy a delicious cookies! I finish eating 
the cookies during our conversation. 
 
 



You: thanks for the cookies. They were amazing! :D 
 
R. Dash: hehe *giggles*. No problem, we can make you more if you want, 
just please focus in getting better. Everyone is waiting for you. 
Besides, we’re worried about you because we figured life at the hospital 
would be hard on you. 
 
You: heh… it is. Like, yesterday an old man thought my room was his and 
started sleeping in my bed. And getting out of my bed and into my 
wheelchair is a lot harder that it looks. 
 
R. Dash: hehe, at least you look like you’re feeling better, but it sounds 
like things really are difficult here :/ . Well, I have all this day free, so I will 
do whatever you want ^_^. 
 
You: I think Im good. Besides, it’s almost lunchtime. You should probably 
start heading back home.  
 
What. Did you think I was going to use those wonderful words to take 
advantage of Dashie? HAH.  
 
R. Dash: oh, im fine. Don’t worry ^-^ 
 
You: it’s just… my arm’s a bit… heh.. 
 
R. Dash: oh, you’re worried about that? I don’t care. 
 
You: but… :S 
 
R. Dash: what’s wrong? Is there another reason you want me to leave? >:( 
 
You: not at all.. haha… :’D  
 
The hospital door quietly opens. 
 
Nurse: hey, im coming in ^-^ 
 
You: Miss Heavenshine, good afternoon! *0* 
 
R. Dash: …?! O.o 



 
The sweet nurse caring for me is extremely beautiful with a great body as 
well :DD!! In other words, she’s the perfect woman--- like a man’s ideals 
come to life!!!  
 
Nurse: you’re always in such a good mood hehe *giggles*. You just bring a 
smile to my face  
 
You: It’s the only thing im good at, after all!! Huehuehue >:)  
 
After seeing both of us share a smile, ahm… errr…. her name is…. oh yes, 
Dashie!, she instantly undertands what’s going on. 
 
R. Dash: I see… so, this is what that was all about… -_-‘… … … I CANT 
BELIEVE YOU!! Even after being hospitalized, you still cant take a break 
from chasing after girls?! 
 
You: i-im not chasing after anyone! She’s the nurse taking care of me :S. 
 
R. Dash: uh-huh. And this is why you wanted me to leave? >:(  
 
You: he-hehe.. it’s just, life at the hospital can be pretty rough, you know? 
What’s wrong with having a little happiness? 
 
R. Dash: don’t get fresh with me!! We need to have a little talk later! Dx 
 
Nurse: now, now.  
 
The nurse places a hand on Dash’s shoulder and caringly smiles. 
 
Nurse: He is still recovering. What he needs right now is love and care. 
 
R. Dash: …!  
 
You: Exactly. Give me love, Miss Heavenshine!! :D 
 
Dash falls silent, seemingly frustrated because she can’t blow up on me 
anymore in front of the nurse. 
 



Nurse: awww hehehe *giggles* ^-^. All I want is for you to get well soon, 
sweetie.  
 
You: heh, I don’t mind staying here forever as long as you’re here! Haha. 
^///^. 
 
Nurse:  Okay, I'll go find the Kinesiologist  . I'll be back soon. 
 
*The nurse leaves the room* 

 

R. Dash: So… do you want to stay here with her forever? I can help you, 
sweetie ^-^’. 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 

-SMASH!!!!- 
 



 
 
You: OOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOFFFFF!!!!! XoX 
 
R. Dash: you’re welcome, SWEETIE!! Now that nurse can continue to take 
care of you! Hmpt!  
 



I think Dash is angry with me ... o.o 
  
You: Hey why did you do that?! D’x 
 
R. Dash: I was so worried about you! I even bought new clothes just for 
you and that's how you treat me?! Insensitive! DX 
 
Am I insensitive? In other words: I am the injured one, she hits me and I 
am the insensitive person...hmm. 100% logic -_-‘. Luckily it wasn't a strong 
blow at least. 
 
- 10 minutes of awkward silence later ... - 
 
Nurse: The kinesiologist is waiting for you, sweetie ... let me help you with 
the wheelchair. ^-^ 
 
R. Dash: …  
 
*Rainbow Dash looks at you * 
 
You: º-º .. *gulp* .. ahem… don’t worry Miss Heavenshine, Dashie can help 
me with this, right? *you look at R. Dash* 
 
R. Dash: huh? Are you sure? I thought you liked your nurse helping you 
¬.¬’ 
 
Nurse: hehehe ^^ 
 
For some reason, the nurse laughs as she looks at us. O_O 
 
Nurse: Seeing you argue like this, it seems like the two of you are dating ... 
if you know what I mean ^_^. 
 
R. Dash: º///º .. dating? 
 
You: º///º 
 
 
 



Nurse: Hahaha, oops, my bad. It's pretty obvious that he is your boyfriend 
^^. Hey, If you want you can accompany him to therapy with the 
Kinesiologist ... it would be good for his rehabilitation if his girlfriend is 
there with him. 
 
My what?! 
 
You: heh, It's funny but I think there is a misunderstanding here ... you 
see, she is not my ... 
 
R. Dash: Sure, I'd love to go with him. Maybe I can help ^-^. 
 
Really she's not even going to deny it ?! O_O? ---  
 
I spent a couple of hours with the Kinesiologist, Rainbow Dash was with 
me too. The kinesiologist and the nurse are sure that I will be able to walk 
again in no time, but I still need to rest and not do unnecessary force. 
 
After doing my exercises, I returned with the nurse and Dashie to my 
hospital room. 
 
Nurse: Good work, sweetie ^-^. Now, all you need to do is rest. Tomorrow 
we will continue with the next session.  
 
*The nurse looks at Dash* 
 
Nurse: I leave you in good hands here hehehe. Bye   
 
*The nurse close the door* 
 
You:  Hey Dash, thanks for joining me with the Kinesiologist. The truth is 
that it's great to have a friend around :) 
 
R. Dash: no problemo! Like the nurse said, you did a good work. I can 
start preparing a new route to run together once you leave this hospital 
^_^. 
 
You: oh sure hehe XD. … …  
 
R. Dash: ... … ahm.. hey… 



 
You: yes?  
 
R. Dash: When I said that I really wanted to see you ... it was true. 
 
Dash looks at me while little by little, her cheeks start to turn crimson ... 
 
You: oh… yeah… hehe… the feeling is mutual :) .  
 
Dash walks towards me and sits next to me O///o… 
 
R. Dash: do you remember our beach vacation? 
 
You: ahm… yes. We had lots of fun! Do you remember the buffet that 
night? Pinkie only ate sweet pancakes and ended up with a stomach ache 
xD.. Or Sunset destroying us in all the video games that we play haha. 
 
R. Dash: hahaha, yes you right XD. 
 
Dash is silent for a few minutes, then speaks again. 
 
R. Dash: Although I was referring to the two of us ... in my special place. 
 
You: oh… that.  
 
An event like that is not easily forgotten! Dash gave me a kiss in her 
special place, saying she wanted "her own story" or something like that. It 
was something unexpected ... I did not know what to say or how to react, 
but ... what is all this about? 
 
R. Dash: When you were fighting against the doppelganger, we were 
afraid ... of losing you. When I saw you fight him, I didn't want you to get 
hurt…  
 
You: …  
 
Dash is speaking very seriously now, she is usually a cheerful girl, but again 
... why this change in attitude so suddenly? 
 



R. Dash: At that moment, the only thing I remembered was the exact 
moment when I showed you my secret place on that beach. I didn't want 
anything bad to happen to you, because I wanted to go there with you 
again and…. 
 
Once she says those words, Dash leans in towards me ... the sunshine 
enter through the window and make Rainbow Dash look like an angel ... 
she looks breathtakingly beautiful. My heart beats like it's about to break 
out of my chest ...!! 
 
R. Dash: And I not only want to go there, but I want to go to many places 
with you ... because it makes me very happy when you are by my side. I 
want to stay by your side forever. I want to stand next to you… even after 
we graduate from the school… I want to stay close to you even after that. 
And that’s because… I-I…  
 

 
 
You: ….?!! 
 
This… this is real? … It’s a dream? What the heck is happening just now !! 
Our lips meet… remembering our first kiss on that beach. 
 
R. Dash: hmmm mmn.. *kiss* 
 
And in the same way as on that occasion ... I don't know what to say or 
how to react ... moments later, Dashie stops.  
 
R. Dash: *pant* ahh..  
 



Suddenly, the nurse knocks on the door and enter to my room. 
 
Nurse: Dash, right? Sorry but visiting time is over. 
 
R. Dash: oh okay, no problem hehe. My bad. ^^ 
 
Dashie stands up and walks to the door with the nurse. 
 
R. Dash: Focus on recovering, dummy! hehe. See you soon ^-^. 
 
You: … ah… o-okay. See ya.  
 
Rainbow Dash and the nurse leave the room.  
 
You: … … …  
 

WHAAAAAAAA
AAAAAAAAAA
AAAAAAAT??!!
!!! º///º 

-END- XD 


